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ecumenical understanding. She ranges over 
questions of authority in the Reform ation de­
bates and their background in the church fa. 
thers and the Middle Ages. She ell:amines 
the debates over the autho rity of Scripture 
and tradition; justification, penan ce , and the 
"power to bind and loose;" the eucharist and 
the mass: the nature of the church: the minis­
II)' and priestly and episcopal ordination; pa­
pal primacy, the authority of councils; and 
the authority to decide truth in a divided 
church. 

EV ANS, James H. We have been believers: 
an African-American systematic theology. 
Minneapolis: Fortress Press. 1992. xii. 178 
p. Pap. $12.95. 0-8006 -2672-9 . 

James H. Evans, Jr., is president and 
Robert K. Davies Professor of Systematic 
Theology at Colgate Rochester Divinity 
School. His aim is "10 articulate, interpret. 
and assess the essential doctrinal affinna­
tions of African-American faith for the con­
temporary African-Am erican community of 
faith." The opening chapter deals with theo­
logica.l methodology as it applies 10 black 
theologians. Then after a chapter on the 
Bible "as an imaginative tell:t. the meaning 
of which is most clearly visible to those who 
experience marginalization and powerless­
ness," he treats the doctrines of God, Christ. 
humanity, church, and eschatology in black 
theology. 

EXPERIENCING THE ENNEAGRAM. 
fBy Richard Rohr et aJ.] Edited by Andreas 
Ebert and Marion KUstenmacher. Translated 
by Peter Heinegg. New York: Crossro:id, 
1992. viii, 251 p. Pap. S 13. 95. 0-8245- 1201-
4. 

Richard Rohr, a Franciscan of the Cin­
cinnati Province, is director of the Center for 
Action and Contemplation in Albuquerque, 
New Mexico. Andreas Ebert is a Lutheran 
minister and hymn writer. This compendium 
begins with a keynote address on the Ennea­
gram given in Wilrzburg by Fr . Rohr. Then 
he briefly summarizes each of the nine En­
neagrwn types. Other essays relate the En­
neagram to focusing, development. the 
church, nine images of the soul of Christ. 
possibilities and dangers for pastoral care , 
building community, and the Bible. The 
book ends with some personal testimonies 
and a 115-item test to help a person discern 
his or her type. 
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FAGERBERG, David W. What is liturgi• 
cal theology? A study in merhodology. Col­
legeville, MN: A Pueblo Book. The Liturgi­
cal Press, 1992. 342 p. Pap. $22.95. 0-8146-
6122-X. 

David Fagcrbe rg teaches at Concordia 
College, Moorhead, Minnesota. He distin­
guishes four unders :andings of the rei:ition­
ship between liturgy and theology: 1) theolo­
gy of worship (the primary topic of which is 
worship , liturgy being one example): 2) the­
ology from worship (which treats liturgy as 
a resource for doctrine); 3) liturgical theolo­
gy proper ("the faith of the church coming 
into exis tence, epiphanized and preserved in 
liturgical rite"); and 4) the study of liturgical 
tl1eology (i.e. the study of the third under ­
standing). He reserves the title "liturgical 
theology" for the third understanding. He 
examines two examples from contemporary 
authors, of theo logies of worship, two from 
worship, and Alexander Schmemann's Or­
tl1odox perspective , which closely resembles 
his own understanding. 

FAITH AND PRACTICE OF ISLAM: 
three thirteenth centu ry Sufi texts. Trans­
lated, introduced, and annotated by William 
C. 01ittick. Albany: State Univ. of New 
York Press, 1992. xv, 306 p. (SUNY series 
in Islam) 559.50. 0-7914-1367-5. Pap. 
$19.95. 0-7914-1368-3. 

This is a translation of three Persian texts 
written from a Sufi perspective about the 
year 650 (1252 C.E.). They present simply 
and clearly the autho r' s understanding of ba­
sic Islamic faith and practice. The author is 
prob:ibly a Sufi master called Nasir a!-Din. 
The three treati ses are entitled: I) The Rising 
Places of Faith; 2) Clarifications for Begin­
ners and Reminders for rite Advanced; 3) 
The Easy Roads of Say/ a/•Dfn. Professor 
Chittick. of the State University of New 
York, Stony Brook, provides introductions, 
extensive notes, a discussion of "Sufism and 
Islam," a bibliography, and three indexes. 

FELTON, Gayle Carlton. This gift of wa­
ter: the practice and tl~ology of baptism 
anwng Methodists in America . Nashville: 
Abingdon Press, 1992. 249 p. Pap. $16.95. 
0-687-33327-X. 

Gayle Felton teaches Christian nurture nt 
Duke Divinity School and is a member o f 
the United Methodist Church General Con­
ference Committee to Study Baptism. She 
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ence itself (variously interpreted) as the fun­
damental source of religious insight." devel­
oped primarily at the Divinity School of the 
University of Chicago and is closely related 
to process theology. Randolph Miller, Hor­
ace Bushnell Professor of Christian Nunure, 
Emeritus, at Yale University Divinity 
School, asked ten experts to contribute to 
this guide. Pan One treats the history and 
major themes of empirical theology and 
shows how it is related to science and classi­
cal theology. Pan Two treats empiricism as 
it relates to God, Christ. humankind, the 
church, the good, and the integrity of crea­
tion. Pan Three deals with empirical theolo­
gy in pastoral care and the life of the local 
congregation. 

EPISCOPAL WOMEN: gender, spiritual­
ity, and commitment in an American 
mainline denomination. Edited by Cathe­
rine M Prelinger. New York: Oxford Univ. 
Press, 1992. xii, 363 p. (Religion in America 
series) $24.95. 0-19-507433-5. 

The late Catherine Prelinger was assist­
ant editor of the Benjamin Franklin Papers 
Project at Yale University. This volume 
stems from a project undertaken at the re­
quest of the Lilly Foundation which was de­
signed to explore the situation of women in 
mainline Protestantism using the Episcopal 
Church as a case study. The subjects treated 
include lay women's participation in Episco­
pal Church councils, the growing presence 
of women priests and elderly women, the in­
teraction of lay men and women in leader­
ship roles, the contrast between Episcopal 
and Evangelical women, women's denomi­
national loyalty, the impact of ordained 
women, and African American women in 
the Episcopal Church. 

ETHICS, RELIGION, AND THE GOOD 
SOCIETY: new directions in a pluralistic 
world. Joseph Runzo, editor. Louisville: 
Westminster/John Knox Press, 1992. xxiii, 
200 p. Pap. $23.99. 0-664-25285-0. 

This volume evolved out of the eleventh 
annual Philosophy of Religion Conference 
at aaremont Graduate School where Joseph 
Run1.0, professor of philosophy and religion 
at Chapman College, has been a visiting pro­
fessor. The first six essays deal with funda­
mental questions of the nature of the good. 
and of the good or moral life. The next six 
address the question of what makes for a 

good society, vis-a-vis religion, and what 
ethical problems we confront in attempting 
to achieve a good society. The last five es­
says center on dialogue, taking up the ethical 
dimensions of the problem of global reli­
gious pluralism. 

EVANS, Craig A. Jesus. Grand Rapids: 
Baker Book House, 1992. 152 p. (IBR bibli­
ographies, n. 5) Pap. $9.95. 0-8010-3218-0. 

This is the first volume in a new series 
sponsored by the Institute for Biblical Re­
search. Craig Evans teaches biblical studies 
at Trinity Western University in Langley, 
British Columbia. This is an updated and 
abridged edition of his I.if e a/ Jesus Re­
search: an Annotated Bibliography (Leiden: 
E. J. Brill, 1989). It retains only the most im­
ponant foreign language items and adds new 
items which appeared between 1988 and 
1991. The focus is on the most significant 
scholarship concerned with the problem of 
the historical Jesus. The 566 entries are clas­
sified under forty headings and are briefly 
annotated. The Institute plans to update each 
bibliography every five years. 

EVANS, Donald. Spirituality and human 
nature. Albany: State Univ. of New York 
Press, 1992. x, 314 p. (SUNY series in reli­
gious studies) $44.95. 0-7914-1279-2. Pap. 
$14.95. 0-7914-1280-6. 

Donald Evans is professor of philosophy 
at Victoria College, University of Toronto. 
His courses have been called "weird." He 
agrees that his book is "deviant." because it 
proposes a controversial conception of spiri­
tuality, one that not only focuses on "the un­
derlying motivation and orientation we bring 
to whatever we experience or do," but also 
"includes becoming aware of spiritual pres­
ences and spiritual energies, as 1t did for our 
'primitive' ancestors." Dealing with spiritu­
ality in relation to depth psychology, skepti­
cism, ethics, and religion, he ranges over 
personal experience, para-normal phenome­
na. and Eastern and Western mysticism. 

EV ANS, G. R. (Gillian Rosemary). Prob­
lems of authority in the Reformation de­
bates. New York: Cambridge Univ. Press, 
1992. xv, 328 p. $59.95. 0-521-41686-8. 

Gillian Evans, lecturer in history in the 
University of Cambridge. shows how the 
failure of the theological debates of the Ref­
onnation period can help toward present-day 
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